
 

Dubbo West Public School 

Week 3 Learning from Home Rubric – Year 3 & 4  
 Draw up 3 column notes 

for 10 spelling words. 
Write the word, draw a 

picture and find the 
meaning of each. 

If possible, organise to 
meet your classmates in 
Mathletics to compete 

against each other in the 
arenas. 

Work on Study Ladder for 
20minute blocks. 

Rainbow sounds with 
your spelling words  

 

Select 10 words from a 
book you are reading and 
use a dictionary (online) 
to write the meanings 
of these words. 

Make a find-a-word with 
your spelling words. Test 

your family 

In your journal, write 
down the age of everyone 

in your home. For each 
person, create a multi-

step word problem using 
their age as the answer. 

Go to  
https://www.abc.net.au/b
tn/classroom/     and 
watch the latest 
classroom episode of 
BTN. Write 5 new facts 

Read, read, read and read 

some more! 

Breaking up the day with 

10 - 20 minutes blocks of 

reading will add up so 

quickly 

 

Practice your times 
tables, both from 

memory as well as using 
other strategies, (e.g. 6x7 

is 5x7+7) 

Create a picture using cut 
up fruit or vegetables. 
Write a story to match 

your picture. Who? 
What? Where? When? 

Why?  

Where is the most 
unusual place you can 
find to read a book? 
Under the bed? Up a 

tree? You choose 

Go to 
https://www.kidsnews.co
m.au/ and check out the 
latest daily news events. 
You can choose green, 
orange or red. Read the 
article and answer 
questions 

Continue your journal, 
write as little as one 

paragraph a day. Write in 
the morning about what 
you want to do that day 

and /or write in the 
evening what you ended 

up doing. 

Write a story pretending 
you are representing 

Australia at the Olympic 
or Paralympic games. 
What sport would you 

compete in? How would 
you feel? Training 

schedule?  

Write a letter to your 
teacher. Tell them what 

you love about home 

schooling. Then, send 

them the letter 

electronically. 

Watch some Paralympics. 
Write 10 facts about your 

favourite athlete.  

List as many differences 
as you can between the 
Olympic Games and the 

Paralympic Games. 

Start a sketching 
notebook, try to add a 
sketch each day, both 

originals and ones from 
YouTube. 

Work on Prodigy for 
blocks of around 

20minutes at a time. 

Count how many steps 
around the boundary of 

your back yard. How 
many laps would you 

need to do to walk 1km, 
5km, 10km? 

Go to  
https://www.reptilepark.c

om.au/educationhub/ 
and watch a live and take 

notes about one of the 
reptiles or birds.  

Write an information 
report using this 

information. 

Draw up 3 column notes. 
In the kitchen, find as 

many 3D objects as you 
can. Eg. 

Cylinder|Can|Drawing 
Cube|Clock| Drawing 

Find Go-Noodle and do 
some dances and other 
activities. Have a dance 
off against your parents. 

https://www.gonoodle.co
m/for-families/ 

Read, read, read and read 
some more! 

Breaking up the day with 
10 - 20 minutes blocks of 

reading will add up so 
quickly 

 

  

 

Suggested Day Plan 

Morning 

• Write your spelling words out each 

day. 

• Log in to Study Ladder and complete 

reading activities for 30 minutes. 

• Read for 20 minutes to yourself or to 

someone else.  

• Log in to typing.com for 10 minutes. 

Middle of the Day 

• Practise your times tables. 

• Log in to Mathletics for 30 minutes. 

• Complete a Learning at Home Rubric 

task. 

Afternoon 

• Lego or Building or Just Dance 

Online Learning Websites 

Typing.com  
www.typing.com   

Studyladder 
https://www.studyladder.com.au/ 

Mathletics  
https://login.mathletics.com/  
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